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Concept Mapping Results: Peer Support Outcomes Protocol Project 
 
 
In 1997, Dr. Jean Campbell of the Missouri Institute of Mental Health, University 
of Missouri, convened a group of mental health consumers and nonconsumers in  
St. Louis to generate potential items for the Peer Support Outcomes Protocol 
(POP).  The development of the protocol and concept mapping session were 
funded as part of the 1995-2000 University of Illinois at Chicago’s (UIC) National 
Research and Training Center (NRTC) on Psychiatric Disability.  First, Dr. 
Campbell conducted an extensive review of the consumer program evaluation 
and outcome literature to generate a list of draft items. Subsequently, she led 
two-day concept mapping meetings at the Independence Center and the St. 
Louis Empowerment Center. Program members grouped items into conceptual 
domains, ranked them by importance, and finally analyzed the results to 
generate three-dimensional maps showing the relationships of items and 
domains to each other.   
 
Concept mapping is a process that can be used to help a group describe its 
ideas on any topic of interest (Trochim, 1989a).  The process typically requires 
the participants to brainstorm a large set of statements relevant to the topic of 
interest, individually sort these statements into piles of similar ones, rate each 
statement on some scale, and interpret the maps that result from the data 
analyses.  The analyses typically include a two-dimensional multidimensional 
scaling (MDS) of the unstructured sort data, a hierarchical cluster analysis of the 
MDS coordinates, and the computation of average ratings for each statement 
and cluster of statements.  The maps that result show the individual statements 
in two-dimensional (x,y) space with more similar statements located nearer each 
other, and show how the statements are grouped into clusters that partition the 
space on the map.  Participants are led through a structured interpretation 
session designed to help them understand the maps and label them in a 
substantively meaningful way. 
 
 The concept mapping was first described by Trochim and Linton (1986).  
Trochim (1989a) delineates the process in detail and Trochim (1989b) presents a 
wide range of example projects.  Concept mapping has received considerable 
use and appears to be growing in popularity.  It has been used to address 
substantive issues in the social services (Galvin, 1989; Mannes, 1989), mental 
health (Cook, 1992; Kane, 1992; Lassegard, 1993; Marquart, 1988; Marquart, 
1992; Marquart et al, 1993; Penney, 1992; Ryan and Pursley, 1992; Shern, 1992; 
Trochim, 1989a; Trochim and Cook, 1992; Trochim, Cook & Setze, 1994; in 
press; Valentine, 1992), health care (Valentine, 1989), education (Grayson, 
1993; Kohler, 1992; Kohler, 1993), educational administration (Gurowitz et al, 
1988), and theory development (Linton, 1989).  Considerable methodological 
work on the concept mapping process and its potential utility has also been 
accomplished (Bragg and Grayson, 1993; Caracelli, 1989; Cooksy, 1989; Davis, 
1989; Dumont, 1989; Grayson, 1992; Keith, 1989; Lassegard, 1992; Marquart, 



1989; Mead and Bowers, 1992; Mercer, 1992; SenGupta, 1993; Trochim, 1985 , 
1989c, 1990). 
 
Concept Mapping begins with a structured brainstorming session (Osborn, 1948) 
guided by a specific focus prompt that limits the types of statements that are 
acceptable.  Concept mapping participants were asked to generate a list of 
statements that asked individuals about aspects of their lives that would be 
enhanced by participating in peer support programs.  The general rules of 
brainstorming applied.  Participants were encouraged to generate as many 
statements as possible (an upper limit of 200 was imposed); no criticism or 
discussion of other's statements was allowed (except for purposes of 
clarification); and all participants were encouraged to take part.  The group 
brainstormed 145 statements in approximately two hours.  Next, participants 
were asked to rate the importance of each statement from each statement on a 
5-point Likert-type response scale with the anchors of (1) relatively unimportant, 
(2) somewhat unimportant, (3) moderately important, (4) very important, and (5) 
extremely important.  Because participants were unlikely to brainstorm 
statements that were completely unimportant, it was stressed that the ratings 
should be considered a relative judgment of the importance of each item in 
comparison to all the other items brainstormed. The complete list of brainstormed 
statements ranked in descending order of importance is provided in the Results 
section (see Appendix to this report) in a list entitled “Statements by Ratings-
Descending.”  Inspection of this list reveals that participants generated a wide 
range of statements, covering diverse aspects of peer support programming such 
as recovery (e.g., how well do you understand your recovery process [ #39]), 
employment (e.g., do you know what it takes to keep a job [#98]), program 
characteristics (e.g., is the location of the program convenient for you [#126]), 
independent living (do you get to choose where you live[#5]), and general well-
being (do you feel spiritually in touch with life [#35]). 
 
Next, respondents were instructed to group the 145 statement strips into piles "in 
a way that makes sense to you." The only restrictions in this sorting task were 
that there could not be: (a) N piles (in this case 145 piles of one item each); (b) 
one pile consisting of all 145 items; or (c) a "miscellaneous" pile (any item 
thought to be unique was to be placed in its own separate pile).   
 
After sorting the statements, the participants assigned to each of their piles a 
unique label that they felt accurately reflected the statements contained in that 
pile (such as “Basic Resources,”  “Safety Issues” or “Activities Away from 
Illness”).  Each person then recorded the contents of each pile by listing the pile 
label and the statement identifying numbers on a sheet that was provided to 
them by the facilitators.  Following that, each participant was asked to rate the 
importance of the pile using the same Likert scale described above.  The 
clustered statements, names for clusters, and average cluster ratings are 
presented in the list entitled “Statements by Cluster.”  The following Cluster 
names were discussed and agreed to by the group: 



 
1. Basic Resources 
2. Safety Issues 
3. Work in Everyday Life 
4. Activities Away from Illness 
5. Control Over Quality of Life 
6. Knowledge and Understanding of Illness and Recovery 
7. Program and Staff 
8. Unsort 16-Satisfaction 

 
Next, the project facilitators entered the sorting and rating data into the computer, 
conducted the MDS and cluster analyses, and produced materials for the group 
to utilize in the Interpretation step.  These maps are shown in the Results section 
on the map labeled “Cluster Rating Map: 8 Clusters.”  This is a three dimensional 
representation of each cluster’s overall importance as indicated by the number of 
value layers.  As the number of layers increase on a cluster so does its value of 
importance as a group of important peer program outcomes for program 
members.  The most highly valued clusters were Knowledge and Understanding 
of Mental Illness and Recovery; Basic Resources; Program and Staff; and 
Unsort16-Satisfaction. 
 
Finally, graphs referred to as “pattern matches” were handed out to participants.  
These were based on participants’ self-definitions in terms of their gender (male 
vs. female) and the type of peer program they were representing (empowerment 
center vs. independence center), in the demographic survey they completed on 
the first day.  These maps showed how the different groups rated the overall 
importance of each of the eleven clusters.  For example, in the figure entitled 
“Pattern Match:  Male to Female,” cluster labels on the left side of the map show 
how male participants ranked each cluster’s order of importance.  Conversely, 
cluster labels on the right side show how female participants ranked each 
cluster’s order of importance.  The lines indicate the level of agreement between 
males and females on cluster ratings.  If the line goes down from the left to the 
right (as it does with the cluster “Basic Resources”), this means that males rated 
this cluster as being more important than females providers.  Conversely, a line 
going down from the right to the left (as it did with the cluster “Work and 
Everyday Life) means that this cluster was rated higher by females than males   
 
The correlation coefficient for this map is r=.56, indicating a fairly high agreement 
between males and females on their importance rankings of clusters.  For 
example, the following three clusters received similar ranks of importance from 
both groups: Knowledge and Understanding of Illness and Recovery; Program 
and Staff; and Control Over Quality of Life.  However, although the Knowledge 
and Understanding cluster has the same rank order (3rd most important for both 
groups), there is a slight variation in the level of agreement as depicted by the 
slight angle of the line.  Agreement between groups also was demonstrated 
when considering the last three clusters shown on the map – both groups ranked 



the same two clusters (Activities Away from Illness and Control Over Quality of 
Life) as being one of the three lowest in importance.     
 
These clusters and the items that comprised them served as the initial set of 
items considered for inclusion in the POP.  The concept mapping process 
successfully identified and verified the types of consumer outcomes that should 
be assessed among participants in peer programs.  With appreciation and 
acknowledgment of the time and talent of the program members from the 
Independence Center and the St. Louis Empowerment Center, the investigators 
were provided with a solid foundation on which to base future work in developing 
a set of assessment items and the resulting POP protocol. 
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Appendix: 
Concept Mapping Results 
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